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Beloved Local Faith Leader Chester
Pullings Passes Away at 83

Chester Allen Pullings, a devoted community member and
active participant in the Pine Grove Missionary Baptist

Church, has passed away at the age of 83. Born on
September 7, 1941, in Blitchton, Florida, Chester dedicated

his life to faith and service. He was the son of James and
Aldonia Pullings and received his early education

&amp;hellip;

Ocala, Florida, USA - Chester Allen Pullings, a devoted
community member and active participant in the Pine Grove
Missionary Baptist Church, has passed away at the age of 83.
Born on September 7, 1941, in Blitchton, Florida, Chester
dedicated his life to faith and service. He was the son of James
and Aldonia Pullings and received his early education at Pine
Grove Elementary School. Chester accepted Christ at a young
age and remained a steadfast believer throughout his life,
fulfilling numerous roles at his church, from Chairman of the



Deacon Board to President of the Usher Board and
Superintendent of Sunday School. His contributions were
significant, underpinning a strong sense of community and faith
in the lives of those around him. Chester died on May 26, 2025,
leaving behind a rich legacy steeped in faith and family, as
reported by Ocala News.

Chester’s life was filled with love and commitment, particularly
to his family. He married Evangelist Mattie Helfin Pullings on
September 14, 2014, in Morriston, Florida. Their union was a
testament to their shared faith and dedication to service. Mattie,
who was born on September 22, 1944, in Ocala, Florida, also led
a life of notable contributions to her community. She was a
member of This Cup Ministries and dedicated her life to
evangelism and service. Mattie passed away before Chester on
January 30, 2025, and like her husband, she left a deep mark on
the hearts of many in the community, as stated by J. Hadley
Funeral Home.

A Life Well Lived

Chester’s legacy continues through his family, which includes his
sons, Allen Pullings, Amos Oliver, Raheem Wilson, and Derrick
Oliver, alongside daughters Fayola Williamson, Fondreika
Wilson, Shedria Thomas, Andrea Jones, and Lena Mae
Richardson. He was preceded in death by significant family
members, including his wives, Dorothy Bell Pullings and Mattie,
as well as his son, James “Mickey” Pullings, and his daughter,
Naticha Hames. The family has not only lost a father but a pillar
of strength and wisdom.

Mattie’s dedication to faith and love reflects his legacy. She, too,
enjoyed a fruitful life, being not just a mother, but also a
cherished cornerstone of her church community. She is survived
by her children and a multitude of grandchildren, ensuring that
her love and values will be passed down through generations.
The couple’s shared dedication to uplifting others and engaging
in community service stands out as a beacon for family and
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friends alike.

A Community’s Heart

Both Chester and Mattie Pullings are remembered for their
legacy of love, faith, and service to the community. Chester
enjoyed farming and fishing during his leisure time, crafting
bonds with family while engaging with nature. The faith that he
and Mattie shared was integral to their identities and influenced
many around them. Their enduring spirits offer a reminder of the
importance of community, service, and faith, shining brightly
even in their absence.

As the community mourns the loss of both Chester and Mattie
Pullings, their influence will continue to resonate among their
loved ones and the broader community. Their lives embody the
essence of dedication and compassion, traits that many aspire
to emulate.

Details
Ort Ocala, Florida, USA
Quellen www.ocala-news.com

www.jhadleyfh.com

Besuchen Sie uns auf: mein-wien.net

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

https://www.ocala-news.com/2025/06/10/allen-chester-pullings/
https://www.jhadleyfh.com/obituary/MATTIE-PULLINGS
https://mein-wien.net
http://www.tcpdf.org

