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Join the Mayor’s Citizen Academy: Shape
Orange County’s Future!

Orange County&#039;s Mayor’s Citizens Academy returns
Fall 2025, offering residents insights into local government.

Apply by July 1!

Orange County, USA - Residents of Orange County, mark your
calendars! The eagerly anticipated Orange County Mayor’s
Citizen Academy is set to return for the Fall 2025 session,
running from July 31 to October 2, 2025. This ten-week program
promises an engaging deep dive into the world of local
government operations and is open to residents aged 18 and
older who are eager to learn more about their community.

The Academy sessions will take place Thursday evenings from
5:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m. at various Orange County Government
facilities. Would-be participants are encouraged to apply as soon
as the application window opens on July 1, 2025, as spots are
limited and offered on a first-come, first-served basis. As a great
perk, refreshments will be provided during each session!

Course Content and Benefits

What can attendees expect? The Academy offers an enriching
experience with interactive sessions, guided tours of critical
facilities like Fire Rescue and Animal Services, and opportunities
to engage directly with Orange County leadership. With a
minimum requirement of attending seven sessions to graduate,
participants will gain invaluable insights into county programs,
services, and civic engagement opportunities, as detailed by 
Orange County’s official website.

https://newsroom.ocfl.net/media-advisories/press-releases/2025/06/orange-county-government-announces-the-mayors-citizens-academy-to-return-for-fall-2025-session/


According to Horizon West Happenings, the Academy aims to
enhance civic engagement among participants. Not only does it
illuminate the workings of local government, but it also fosters
networking opportunities with fellow residents and county
leaders. A Community Engagement Manager who attended a
recent session shared that the experience opened up pathways
for further community involvement.

Building Community in Orange County

As part of its broader mission to enhance civic involvement,
Orange County actively encourages citizen collaboration through
various initiatives. These range from the Neighborhood
Sustainability Challenge, which recognizes neighborhoods
fostering environmentally friendly practices, to the Orange
County Experience program that offers citizens opportunities to
better understand local governance through a series of classes
and tours, as highlighted on the Orange County government
website.

Let’s not forget the ongoing volunteer opportunities available
under the OCFL Serves program and the Adopt A Fire Station
initiative. These programs not only promote community service
but also allow residents to make a tangible difference in their
neighborhoods.

As interest in local governance continues to grow, the Mayor’s
Citizens Academy serves as a fantastic launching pad for those
who aspire to be more involved in their community. So, if you’re
an Orange County resident looking to expand your knowledge
and strengthen your ties with local leadership, mark your
calendars and prepare to apply early!
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