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Florida Panthers on the Brink: Can They
Seal the Cup Tonight?

Discover the latest on the NHL Stanley Cup Final as the
Florida Panthers aim for victory against the Oilers. Game 6

details inside.

Amerant Bank Arena, Sunrise, Florida, USA - The Florida
Panthers are making headlines as they lead the NHL Stanley
Cup Final series 3-2 following their recent victory over the
Edmonton Oilers in Game 5, where they won decisively with a
score of 5-2. This puts the Panthers in a prime position to
capture another championship, having previously won the title
in 2024. As Game 6 approaches, anticipation is building among
fans and players alike.

The Panthers‘ performance has been nothing short of
impressive. In Game 5, Brad Marchand stole the spotlight,
scoring two goals and raising his total to six in the series—the
highest for any player in a Stanley Cup Final since 1988. Not to



be outdone, Sam Bennett scored his League-leading 15th goal of
the playoffs, further cementing the team’s offensive power. Eetu
Luostarinen also made an impact with a goal and an assist,
while Sergei Bobrovsky was sturdy in net, making 19 saves to
secure the win.

What’s Next for the Panthers?

Looking ahead, the pivotal Game 6 is scheduled for Tuesday,
June 17, at the Amerant Bank Arena in Sunrise, Florida, kicking
off at 5 p.m. PT/8 p.m. ET. The game will be broadcast live on
TNT, with several live TV streaming options available. Services
like Hulu + Live TV offer a three-day free trial, and Sling Orange
is providing discounts for first-month subscriptions. Fans eager
to witness the action can also watch online at TNTDrama.com or
through the TNT mobile app.

The Panthers are historically in a favorable position after
winning Game 5, as teams that take a 3-2 lead in the series
have won the Stanley Cup 73.1% of the time (19 of 26). Sam
Reinhart underlined the importance of maintaining a focused
mindset for the upcoming game, asserting that staying present
will be critical for their success.

Listen to the Roar of the Fans

Fans can catch the excitement live at the arena. Last-minute
tickets can be snagged through sites like StubHub, Ticket
Liquidator, and Vivid Seats, which is currently offering a discount
code for eligible purchases. There’s a palpable energy in Sunrise
as the Panthers seek to clinch the championship and fulfill their
dreams of lifting the Stanley Cup once again.

This playoff run marks a significant achievement for a franchise
that has reached the Stanley Cup Finals three times— in 1996,
2023, and now 2024. With 11 playoff appearances over 31
seasons, the Panthers are hoping to add yet another chapter to
their story of resilience. Moving forward, fans are eager to see if



this talented team can bring home another victory in what has
been an exciting Stanley Cup playoff season.

As we gear up for Game 6, all eyes will surely be on the ice. Will
the Panthers seize the moment and solidify their place in history
once again? Only time will tell, but one thing is clear—the Florida
Panthers are ready to make history.
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