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South Florida Schools Shine Bright with
Record-Achieving Grades!

Broward County maintains its “A” grade in 2024-25 as
schools show significant recovery from COVID-19
disruptions, reflecting statewide improvements.

Broward County, Florida, USA - In a refreshing turnaround for
education in the Sunshine State, South Florida school districts
have once again dazzled with top marks for the 2024-25
academic year, showing that recovery from the disruptions
caused by the pandemic is well underway. The Florida
Department of Education unveiled some eye-catching high
scores, indicating a statewide boost in public school
performance. In fact, things are looking brighter than ever for
students across the region.

Miami-Dade County schools led the charge with 63% of its
institutions receiving “A” grades, a significant leap from last
year’s 52%. On top of this impressive feat, only two schools



earned “D” ratings, a decrease from four, and the county
proudly reported no schools receiving an “F.” That’s quite the
comeback, wouldn’t you say?

Local Highlights

Not to be outdone, Broward County has held steady with its “A”
grade status as well. Out of its 292 traditional and charter
schools, 53% earned “A” grades, climbing from 42% the
previous year. Similar to Miami-Dade, Broward also celebrated
the absence of any “D” or “F” ratings, showcasing a
commitment to improvement.

Meanwhile, Palm Beach County isn’t lagging behind either; they
saw an increase of “A” grades from 41% to 47%. Though two
schools received “D” ratings, this is still progress from six last
year, with no schools earning an “F.” What a wave of positivity
sweeping through these districts!

On a broader scale, across Florida, 28 out of 67 school districts
received the coveted “A” grades, marking a remarkable six-
district rise since last year. Duval County even made headlines
by achieving its first-ever “A” grade.

A Focus on Improvement

Florida Governor Ron DeSantis has made it a point to highlight
that an impressive 71% of graded schools in Florida received “A”
or “B” grades this year, an uptick from 64% in 2024. A clear
indication that educational strategies are shifting, this year’s
report shows a notable increase of 4% in elementary schools,
9% in middle schools, and 10% in high schools receiving “A”
ratings compared to the last academic year.

What about enrollment numbers? They’ve soared, with nearly
200,000 more students now attending “A” and “B” schools
compared to the previous year. Clearly, there’s something to be
said for a focused approach to education.



The Bigger Picture

Looking at the historical trends, the Florida Department of
Education has chronicled performance data from as far back as
1998-99, showcasing how schools have evolved over time.
Detailed reports include school grades, improvement ratings,
and learning gains in English Language Arts and Mathematics,
shedding light on student performance by school and grade
level.

It’s also worth mentioning that for schools to qualify for grades
and improvement ratings, they must test 90% or more of eligible
students. Such requirements ensure that the data accurately
reflects student achievements. Also, the transition to a progress
monitoring system, assessing student performance three times
a year, has been instrumental in driving these improvements.
It’s all about keeping a good hand on education, after all.

The favorable results from the current academic year paint an
optimistic picture for Florida’s educational landscape. Find out
more about school accountability reports through the Florida
Department of Education and additional insights from the
National Center for Education Statistics.

As we look forward to the coming years, one can’t help but feel
a sense of hope and excitement. There’s a lot to celebrate, and
perhaps even more room for growth. Florida is on the right
track, with the future looking as bright as the summer sun.
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