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Stanley Cup Drama: Panthers Edge
Oilers in Double OT Showdown!

The Stanley Cup Final is tied 1-1 as the Panthers and Oilers
head to Game 3 in Sunrise, Florida, on June 7, 2025.

Sunrise, Florida, USA - As the sun sets on Sunrise, Florida,
anticipation fills the air for Game 3 of the Stanley Cup Final,
happening this Monday at 8 p.m. ET. The series is currently tied
1-1 after an electrifying Game 2 that saw the Florida Panthers
steal a double-overtime victory over the Edmonton Oilers by a
score of 5-4, thanks to Brad Marchand’s game-winning backhand
goal.

Game 2 was not just another chapter in the playoffs; it was a
rollercoaster of emotions for both teams. The first period
brought a flurry of action, with the Oilers racing to a 3-2 lead.
Connor McDavid showcased his playmaking skills, assisting Leon
Draisaitl on a goal that marked Draisaitl’s 10th of the playoffs.



However, the Panthers refused to back down, capitalizing on
power plays and seizing opportunities when they arose.
Marchand, in particular, stole the show by scoring not only the
game-winner but also a pivotal short-handed breakaway goal
that tipped the scales in Florida’s favor.

The Goaltending Battle

In this high-stakes duel, goaltenders Sergei Bobrovsky and
Stuart Skinner exhibited why they’re integral to their teams‘
playoff runs. Bobrovsky made a staggering 84 saves on 92
shots, boasting a .913 save percentage. Most notably, he came
up huge by stopping Kasperi Kapanen during a critical 2-on-1
situation shortly before the decisive moments of the game. His
recent performances have garnered admiration from
teammates, with forward Evan Rodrigues commending him for
his key saves and defenseman Nate Schmidt expressing
gratitude for his contributions.

On the other end of the ice, Skinner also faced his share of
challenges. With 66 saves on 74 shots, he had an .892 save
percentage and allowed a couple of tough goals, including a
deflected shot by Dmitry Kulikov. Oilers coach Kris Knoblauch
noted Skinner’s strong performance despite the tough loss,
emphasizing the need for him to maintain this level of
excellence as the series progresses.

What Lies Ahead

As both teams head into Game 3, crucial questions linger. Can
the Oilers improve their early-game consistency after allowing
three goals on the first ten shots in Game 2? Will the Panthers
be able to maintain their aggressive momentum, particularly in
the third period where they previously struggled? With both
teams eyeing the prize, the strategies they employ at Amerant
Bank Arena could heavily influence the trajectory of this series.

The stakes couldn’t be higher. The Panthers have a noteworthy



ten players in double digits for points this postseason, led by
Sam Bennett, who is currently sitting at 18 points. Meanwhile,
the Oilers have four of the top five scorers, with McDavid leading
the pack with 28 points. The clash between these two talented
rosters promises to produce plenty of fiery competition as they
battle for a chance at the coveted Stanley Cup.

With Game 3 just around the corner, fans from both sides will be
eagerly awaiting to see which team will take the edge. As
history tells us, there’s something to be said for home-ice
advantage, and the Panthers will be counting on their fans to
rally behind them in what promises to be another unforgettable
night of hockey.

For more details, check out NHL.com, USA Today, and ESPN.
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