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Flagler Beach to Rebuild Iconic Pier: A
Stronger, Safer Future Ahead!

Flagler County is starting its $14M pier replacement project
after Hurricane Ian damage, enhancing resilience for

coastal storms.

Flagler Beach, Florida, USA - Flagler Beach, a treasured spot
for both locals and tourists, is set to see significant changes as
construction on the new Flagler Beach Pier replacement kicks off
in the coming weeks. This new structure, which aims to preserve
the historical charm of the old pier while enhancing its
resilience, comes in the wake of the devastating damage caused
by Hurricane Ian in 2022. City leaders, including Mayor Patti
King, are vocal about maintaining the connection to the past,
with plans to save parts of the original pier for historical
significance.

The old pier, originally built in 1928, suffered severe damage
during the hurricane, prompting city officials to decide in 2021



to replace the wooden structure with a more resilient concrete
design. The upcoming pier will rise to a height of 28 feet,
allowing it to withstand wave action from events like 500-year
storms, ensuring that it can better face whatever nature throws
at it. This is no small feat, and as My News 13 reports, the new
construction will utilize concrete pilings rather than wood, which
is a significant shift aimed at improving overall durability against
future hurricanes.

Dismantling the Old and Building the New

The demolition of the iconic pier is officially kicking off on
Monday, following years of planning and securing federal
funding for the $14 million project. Not only will the new pier be
approximately twice the length of its predecessor at 800 feet,
but it will also be five feet wider, providing more space for
visitors to enjoy the stunning ocean views and local wildlife.

City leaders emphasize the need for this replacement project as
a crucial step towards building resilience in the face of
increasing climate challenges. The project is expected to take
between 1.5 to 2 years to complete, with an anticipated end
date in December 2026. The pier has been closed for three
years, creating a palpable sense of anticipation among the
community.

Building Coastal Resilience

According to data presented by the National Ocean Service,
resilience extends beyond just infrastructure; it’s an approach
that communities must adopt to adapt to changing conditions
and recover from disruptions. As threats from storms, marine
debris, and rising sea levels loom, investing in durable
infrastructure like the new Flagler Beach Pier becomes vital. The
ability of communities to withstand disasters hinges on
proactive measures like these, which are designed based on
solid data and planning.

https://mynews13.com/fl/orlando/news/2025/06/17/construction-on-flagler-county-s-pier-replacement-project-starts-soon


In line with these concerns, tools and resources are being made
available to help coastal communities assess risks and mitigate
potential damages. The NOS focuses on enhancing coastal and
ocean resilience, providing communities with import data and
services to help them effectively navigate the challenges posed
by climate change.

As Flagler Beach gears up for the construction of this essential
structure, the excitement in the air is palpable. The uplifting
sentiment surrounding the new pier’s development reflects a
community poised to embrace the future while honoring its
historical roots. With a new height, new materials, and a focus
on resilience, the Flagler Beach Pier is charting a course toward
a more secure future, one wave at a time.

For more details on this significant development, you can check
the articles from Click Orlando and learn about the broader
context of coastal resilience from the National Ocean Service at 
oceanservice.noaa.gov.
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