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Costco Expands: New Stores Coming to
Florida, Texas, and More!

Costco announces new store openings in August 2025
across the U.S., part of its strategy to enhance global

accessibility and growth.

Stuart, Florida, United States - Costco continues its rapid
expansion across North America, with plans to open four new
stores in the United States this coming August. According to 
EDatv, the new locations will be in The Villages, Florida;
Richland, Washington; Allen, Texas; and Spring Valley, Nevada.
Costco is set to launch The Villages grocery store on August 6
and follow with Richland’s opening on August 8. As for Allen and
Spring Valley, those dates remain to be confirmed.

This initiative is part of Costco’s ambitious long-term growth
strategy, targeting to open 25 to 30 new branches annually. In
line with this plan, Costco has already established several
locations in 2023, including stores in Brentwood and Highlands,
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California, as well as in Sharon, Massachusetts, Prosper, Texas,
Stuart, Florida, and Genesee, Michigan.

The Bigger Picture

The expansion effort isn’t only confined to the U.S. Costco is
making significant strides internationally, aiming to open new
warehouses in Rimouski, Quebec, and northern Guadalajara,
Mexico by the end of August. The company currently operates
more than 124 million memberships globally, and its reach
extends beyond North America into countries like Japan,
Australia, South Korea, and Sweden, where recent openings
have taken place in locations such as Minami Alps, Pyeongtaek,
Malmö, and Ardeer.

The Sun adds that Costco is planning a total of seven new
warehouses in August, with locations including The Villages,
Florida (August 6), and Richland, Washington (August 8). With
this push, Costco aims to achieve a total of 914 warehouses
worldwide by the end of fiscal 2025, a testament to its
expanding influence in the retail market.

Driving Forces Behind Expansion

Costco’s growth is largely driven by increasing consumer
demand and the desire to enhance product accessibility. CEO
Ron Vachris has confirmed plans for a total of 27 new
warehouses by the end of 2025, ensuring that the company
continues to meet the changing needs of its members. In fact,
two of Costco’s recent months in gas sales have seen
extraordinary spikes, demonstrating a growing loyalty among
consumers. This trend isn’t just limited to gas; the company has
also improved accessibility in current stores, such as extending
gas station hours across North America.

Moreover, EDatv reports that Costco is prioritizing technological
advancements, piloting new systems aimed at improving
checkout times and expanding payment options. They’ve even
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partnered with Affirm to introduce a ‚buy now, pay later‘ feature
for purchases ranging from $500 to $17,000.

With an eye towards future growth and customer satisfaction,
Costco truly shows that they know how to work smart and keep
their members engaged.

Details
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