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Tragic Assault in Miami-Dade: Father
Barricades After Hurting Son

A recent incident in Miami-Dade County involving a father’s
assault on his son raises urgent concerns about domestic

violence and community safety.

Southwest 122nd Avenue, Miami, FL, USA - In the heart of
Miami-Dade County, a disturbing incident unfolded on Saturday
afternoon when a man barricaded himself in his apartment after
assaulting his five-year-old son. The event took place near the
2000 block of Southwest 122nd Avenue, highlighting the grim
reality of domestic violence that continues to plague
communities across Florida. According to CiberCuba, the
attacker, whose identity has not been disclosed, injured his son
by throwing him against a wall. The child needed medical
attention and was taken to Kendall Regional Hospital for
treatment following the incident, while police commenced an
investigation into the matter.

https://en.cibercuba.com/noticias/2025-06-08-u1-e208574-s27061-nid304558-hombre-atrinchera-tras-golpear-hijo-cinco-anos


When the Miami-Dade police arrived, the situation escalated as
the assailant refused to leave his apartment, leading to a
confrontation with sheriff’s deputies. The need for immediate
intervention in such cases cannot be overstated, especially
considering the alarming statistics surrounding domestic
violence in the area. In fact, Miami-Dade County reported
9,357 cases of domestic violence in 2016, the highest in the
state of Florida. Alarmingly, nearly 85% of children exposed to
domestic violence witness the abuse, which can have lasting
effects on their development.

The Hidden Crisis of Domestic Violence

Just as this incident shocks the community, a separate tragedy
unfolded in Pembroke Pines involving a father charged with
murdering his two-year-old daughter. Jerónimo Anthony Durán, a
33-year-old Cuban-born resident, was arrested for the violent
death of Melody A. R. D. The police report stated that they
responded to a domestic incident at 404 Southwest 177th
Avenue after Durán’s grandmother called them during the
attack. This case further underscores the chilling prevalence of
domestic violence in Miami, culminating in violence against the
most vulnerable—children.

Recent events raise questions about how well our community
can recognize the signs of such violence. As disturbing as it may
seem, Safe Space Foundation notes that domestic violence
affects individuals across all demographics, irrespective of race,
age, or economic status. The organization stresses that abuse
can manifest in various forms—physical, emotional, financial,
and more. Detecting these behaviors early on is crucial for
protection, with authorities urging citizens to report suspicions
of child abuse or domestic violence without delay.

With the sobering fact that 1 in 3 women and 1 in 4 men have
experienced physical violence from an intimate partner in their
lives, there’s a significant risk factor for those in harmful
relationships. The societal implications are dire; many victims

https://www.miamidade.gov/global/initiatives/domesticviolence/facts-statistics.page
https://www.safespacefoundation.org/


face not only physical but also psychological consequences. In
fact, it’s estimated that 3.3 million children witness partner
abuse annually, making them 85% more likely to experience
abuse themselves in environments rife with domestic violence.

Getting Help

The statistics are staggering, but there is help available. For
those affected, resources like hotlines and shelters can offer
vital support. Victims can access a 24-hour domestic violence
hotline at 1-800-500-1119, available in multiple languages,
including English, Spanish, and Creole. Just knowing where to
turn can be a lifeline in times of distress.

October is designated as Domestic Violence Awareness Month in
Miami-Dade County, a reminder that everyone can do their part
in recognizing the signs and standing up against abuse. We
must remain vigilant and proactive in addressing this issue lest
we see more tragic incidents like the recent assaults that have
rocked our community. By uniting and creating a culture of
awareness, we can strive to mitigate the epidemic of domestic
violence that affects so many.
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