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DeSantis Slashes Florida Budget:
Education Funding Takes Major Hit

Bay County updates on Governor DeSantis&#039; $115
billion budget signing, notable education cuts, and key

funding changes effective July 1, 2025.

Wildwood, Florida, USA - As of July 1, 2025, Florida has
officially embarked on its new fiscal year with a budget of $115
billion, signed into law by Governor Ron DeSantis. However, this
year’s budget comes with a twist: DeSantis has exercised his
veto power to axe nearly $600 million from the proposed
spending plan. This significant reduction raises questions about
the future of various educational and public projects across the
state.

On the education front, cuts have been particularly notable.
Among the most alarming decisions, DeSantis vetoed $5.7
million aimed at supporting public radio and television stations,
which are heavily relied upon by schools and universities. He



also canceled funding for a study on cellphone use in high
schools, totaling $356,046. With a new ban on student phone
use in elementary and middle schools coming into effect today,
it’s hard to see the rationale behind eliminating this study. Not
to mention, there are substantial midyear cuts to various
educational programs: $609,500 for the expansion of a nursing
program at Saint Leo University, $2.5 million for a workforce
center at Hillsborough College, and $1 million allocated for an
ARK Innovation Center in Pinellas County schools. While Pinellas
superintendent Kevin Hendrick noted that the district would still
receive $1.5 million in appropriations, many are left wondering
how these cuts will impact the overall educational landscape in
Florida. These details are discussed by Tampa Bay Times.

Impact on Various Projects

The $115.1 billion budget reflects a broader strategy, as
Governor DeSantis has the authority to veto specific line items
within the state’s budget. In total, $1.35 billion in cuts were
enacted, with $567 million coming through those individual
vetoes. The cuts are not limited to education; they affect
numerous programs across the state, from wildlife protection to
infrastructure improvements. Notable projects cut include $200
million for land acquisition linked to the Florida Wildlife Corridor
and $3.1 million for public defenders’ pay in critical areas. In
Brevard County, $5 million for West Shore Jr. Sr. High School’s
expansion and $4.3 million for dredging Sykes Creek were also
vetoed. These cuts, pointed out by Tallahassee.com, highlight
a troubling trend regarding the prioritization of projects that
may benefit fewer constituents.

Moreover, Central Florida saw significant impacts, with projects
worth millions being slashed. Key losses included funding for
public safety initiatives, stormwater improvements, and
assistance programs for homeless veterans and residents
needing septic-to-sewer aid. The repercussions of these budget
cuts reach deep into local communities, as various
municipalities now face tough decisions on how to deliver
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https://www.tallahassee.com/story/news/local/state/2025/06/30/list-everything-gov-desantis-vetoed-from-the-state-budget-this-year/84415014007/


essential services amid funding shortages. The detailed
accounts of these local project losses were well documented by 
Click Orlando.

Looking Ahead

The implications of these budget cuts extend beyond immediate
financial impacts. Florida college students are increasingly
concerned about the potential for reduced Pell grants affecting
their ability to complete their degrees, and we’re now seeing
charter school systems adjusting their policies to accommodate
the turbulent educational climate. As districts aim to navigate
these changes, one thing is clear: the funding landscape will
play a significant role in shaping Florida’s educational journey.

In conclusion, while Governor DeSantis’s budget signing may
have brought a new spending plan into play, the cuts have sent
ripples through numerous sectors requiring urgent attention.
Just as in good business practice, where one weighs risks
against benefits, Florida’s communities will need to brace for the
ripple effects of these fiscal decisions. There’s certainly a lot to
unpack as the state moves forward in its fiscal policies, and it’s
vital for citizens to stay informed and engaged in these
discussions.

Details
Ort Wildwood, Florida, USA
Quellen www.tampabay.com

www.tallahassee.com
www.clickorlando.com

Besuchen Sie uns auf: mein-wien.net

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

https://www.clickorlando.com/news/politics/2025/06/30/desantis-vetoed-nearly-14b-from-the-budget-heres-which-central-florida-projects-lost-money/
https://www.tampabay.com/news/education/2025/07/01/desantis-issues-education-vetoes-before-signing-florida-budget/
https://www.tallahassee.com/story/news/local/state/2025/06/30/list-everything-gov-desantis-vetoed-from-the-state-budget-this-year/84415014007/
https://www.clickorlando.com/news/politics/2025/06/30/desantis-vetoed-nearly-14b-from-the-budget-heres-which-central-florida-projects-lost-money/
https://mein-wien.net
http://www.tcpdf.org

