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Get Ready for National French Fry Day:
Delicious Deals Await!

Celebrate National French Fry Day on July 11, 2025, with
exclusive deals at Lynn Haven&#039;s Wayback Burgers

and other local favorites.

1705 Florida 77, Lynn Haven, USA - As National French Fry
Day approaches on July 11, 2025, food lovers in Panama City
Beach are in for a treat. The day is celebrated annually in the
United States, having been officially moved to the second Friday
of July in 2022 after an online petition by popular chains
Checkers and Rally’s. This year, the holiday not only coincides
with National Slurpee Day but also brings a host of delicious
deals for fry enthusiasts.

The USA TODAY Florida Network’s food journalists recently
highlighted some of the best local restaurant promotions leading
up to this savory celebration. Among these, Wayback Burgers is
stepping up with a standout offer: regular fries for just $1 for



members of its rewards program, an exclusive deal that patrons
can take advantage of at more than 170 locations nationwide,
including two right here in Bay County: one on Panama City
Beach Parkway and the other on Florida 77 in Lynn Haven.

More Tasty Offers

On July 11, Wayback Burgers‘ offer means you don’t need to
combine it with other purchases—just flash your rewards
membership to get your cheap fries. However, it’s important to
note that this deal isn’t valid through third-party delivery
services. It’s a golden opportunity for fry fans to indulge in the
crispy delight as they explore the restaurant’s extensive menu,
which includes a range of burgers, chicken sandwiches, and
hand-dipped milkshakes made with Blue Bunny ice cream.

But Wayback Burgers is just one player in the National French
Fry Day festivities. Checkers is enticing customers with a free
large order of fries to anyone who presents a receipt showing
they bought fries from a competitor recently. It’s a clever way to
drum up interest among fry aficionados. For those who enjoy the
golden arches, McDonald’s will offer free medium fries with any
purchase made through their app on Fridays, including July 11.

Wendy’s is also joining the fry frenzy, offering a free size order
of their famous Hot & Crispy Fries if you spend $5 or more—valid
until July 14. Burger King, meanwhile, has a special for members
of its Royal Perks program, allowing free fries with a purchase of
just $1.

Fry Day Highlights
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