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Marina St. Barth Reopens: Summer
Luxury in the Hamptons Awaits!

Explore the reopening of Marina St. Barth&#039;s luxe
boutiques in the Hamptons for summer 2025, offering

vibrant resort wear.

32 Park Place, East Hampton, NY, USA - This summer,
fashion enthusiasts are flocking to the newly reopened Marina
St. Barth boutiques, which have made a lively return to the
Hamptons. Known for its elegant European resort wear and a
strong connection to the chic lifestyle of St. Barthélemy, Marina
St. Barth has positioned itself as a must-visit for those seeking
summer luxury. Founded by Marina Cocher, the brand
encapsulates the scents and colors of the French Caribbean,
offering a range of items that are perfect for casual afternoons
or glamorous evenings.

With locations in Southampton and East Hampton, as well as a
presence in Florida and online, the boutiques are designed to



transport visitors to an island escape. The vibrant decor features
whitewashed walls and organic textures, embodying the
relaxing feel of beachfront living. Marina Cocher’s commitment
to bringing together both iconic and emerging designers shines
through in this season’s collection, which includes stunning
kaftans, flowy linen dresses, and artisanal accessories, all of
which add a splash of summer joy.

Curated Collections and Unique Offerings

Those visiting the new East Hampton location, which opened in
May 2023, will find an impressive selection of colorful dresses
that cater to various styles. Lisa Frohlich, a local shopper,
recently shared her delight in discovering standout pieces like
the “Spolverino” Dress and the versatile “Gonna Balze” dress
while on the hunt for the perfect outfit for Labor Day. These
delightful finds are just a glimpse of what Marina St. Barth has to
offer, including exclusive silk dresses and chic Italian linen
pieces. The boutique ensures a complete shopping experience,
featuring shoes, hats, and handbags that complement the
clothing collections.

Marina Cocher’s vision transcends mere retail; she aims to
create an experience that captures the sun-kissed lifestyle she
cherishes from her travels. This is not just about purchasing
clothing but embracing a lifestyle imbued with wanderlust. To
browse collections or shop from the comfort of home, customers
can visit the boutique’s online store at marina-stbarth.com.

A Rich Tapestry of Luxury Resort Wear

The allure of luxury resort wear continues to influence summer
fashion, with various brands stepping into the spotlight. The
boutique not only highlights its unique collections but also offers
a welcome nod to the broader world of luxury resort wear. A
piece in Dukes Avenue mentions that each summer, luxury
brands come alive with their signature styles. From Pucci’s eye-
catching prints to Eres’s elegant cuts, the diversity of these

https://marina-stbarth.com


brands offers something special for every traveler. Additionally,
names like Cloe Cassandro and KIVARI introduce sustainable and
bohemian styles that reflect modern aesthetic sensibilities.

Marina St. Barth stands strong among these esteemed brands,
carving out its own niche with carefully curated selections. Each
item reflects the beauty of craftsmanship and an understanding
of how women want to feel during their leisure time. Whether
it’s a luxe kaftan or a chic dress ideal for a coastal brunch,
there’s something here for those looking to bring a touch of
island elegance to their summer wardrobes.

In this vibrant hub of fashion, Marina St. Barth invites both locals
and visitors to embrace the carefree spirit of summer. With
thoughtfully designed collections, a commitment to showcasing
both established and rising designers, and a passion for the
essence of island life, it’s no wonder the boutique is making
waves this season.
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