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Dozens Rescued in Benito Juárez:
Shocking Human Trafficking Bust

Twelve women were rescued in Benito Juárez from human
trafficking; authorities report increasing exploitation trends

worldwide.

Supermanzana 228, Benito Juárez, Mexico - In a recent
crackdown on human trafficking, authorities in Benito Juárez
have successfully rescued twelve women believed to be victims
of exploitation. This alarming incident highlights the ongoing
problem of human trafficking, particularly in the realm of sexual
exploitation. The rescue operation took place in a venue located
in Supermanzana 228, where the women were being employed
under precarious conditions as waitresses and hostesses.
According to Azteca Quintana Roo, the women were coerced
into selling drinks for 350 pesos each, with the establishment
keeping half of the profits. Clients were later offered the option
of sexual services for an additional fee, greatly amplifying the
exploitative situation they faced.

https://www.aztecaquintanaroo.com/doce-mujeres-fueron-rescatadas-presunta-trata-en-benito-juarez-esto-se-sabe


This incident speaks volumes about the grim realities of human
trafficking, a concern that has been intensifying in recent years.
Insights from the UN Office on Drugs and Crime (UNODC) reveal
a staggering 25% increase in detected victims of trafficking over
the past few years, particularly among children and vulnerable
groups. Their Global Human Trafficking Report 2024
indicates that from 2019 to 2022, the number of children and
minors falling victim to forced labor rose by a shocking 47%, and
cases of sexual exploitation among girls surged by 38%.

The Global Context

The data is not only unsettling but also indicative of a broader,
distressing trend. A comprehensive examination from EPData
has documented the prevalence of human trafficking globally.
Between 2003 and 2016, the UNODC recorded 225,000 cases,
revealing that a staggering three-quarters were women and girls
primarily exploited for sexual purposes. In 2016 alone, there
were 24,000 known trafficking victims, highlighting the
increasing visibility of this issue as more countries improve their
data collection methodologies.

The growing phenomenon of unaccompanied minors has also
complicated the landscape, with many children falling prey to
trafficking networks. The UN’s findings further illuminate the
alarming reality that women and girls represent 61% of detected
trafficking victims, with many facing sexual exploitation. This
reality begs the question: How can communities better protect
our most vulnerable individuals, particularly in regions that
struggle with these issues?

Call to Action

The recent rescue in Benito Juárez is a critical reminder that the
fight against human trafficking is ongoing and requires
vigilance. The increasing rates of detection emphasize the need
for better identification and protection systems for victims. We
must rally together to strengthen support structures for those

https://www.unodc.org/unodc/es/press/releases/2024/December/unodc-global-human-trafficking-report_-detected-victims-up-25-per-cent-as-more-children-are-exploited-and-forced-labour-cases-spike.html
https://www.epdata.es/datos/trata-personas-mundo-datos-graficos/427


caught in the grips of exploitation and work towards
comprehensive solutions that address the root causes of
trafficking.

As this situation unfolds, it’s imperative for local communities,
authorities, and NGOs to collaborate more closely to ensure that
those affected receive the necessary support and that
perpetrators face justice. This is not just a local issue; it is a
global crisis that affects millions, and it’s time for action.

Details
Ort Supermanzana 228, Benito Juárez, Mexico
Quellen www.aztecaquintanaroo.com

www.unodc.org
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