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IMSS Faces Financial Storm: Could It
Disappear by 2036?

The IMSS faces financial challenges, with projections of a
potential deficit by 2036, prompting discussions on its long-

term viability.

Ciudad de México, México - The Mexican Social Security
Institute (IMSS) is currently navigating a complex financial
landscape, casting doubts on its long-term viability. A recent
report from Merca20 indicates that without significant changes,
the IMSS could face severe financial insufficiency by 2036,
projected to reach a staggering deficit of over 107 billion pesos
by 2037. As it stands, the reduced growth in formal employment
is a key factor contributing to dwindling revenue from worker
and employer contributions, which were adjusted to a mere
0.6% growth estimate for 2025, well down from 2%.

Reports of an imminent crisis, such as the rather sensationalist
claims appearing on social media about an IMSS „bankruptcy“



by 2033, have been branded by IMSS Director Zoé Robledo as
„false and alarmist.“ Instead, he emphasizes that since 2019,
the institute has successfully tripled its financial reserves—from
200 billion to 600 billion pesos—sufficient to ensure its
operations until at least 2037.

Chronic Conditions and Health Demand

As highlighted by El Universal, the rise in chronic illnesses is an
ever-present challenge for the IMSS. With conditions like
diabetes and hypertension increasingly prevalent, the IMSS is
feeling the strain. The most recent stats show that in 2024, 5
million members were diagnosed with diabetes, and out of that,
about 3.47 million actively sought follow-up care at family
medicine units. Alarmingly, mortality rates due to diabetes in
adults have surged by 16.1% from 1998 to 2023.

Moreover, eight million beneficiaries are grappling with
hypertension, where about 5.35 million received necessary
follow-up care, resulting in a concerning 31.7% increase in
mortality from this condition during the same period. Such
escalating healthcare demands compel the IMSS to allocate
considerable resources toward specialized treatments and
qualified personnel.

Investment and Future Strategies

The IMSS is not just sitting back and letting challenges mount; it
has earmarked a historic investment of 7.454 billion pesos for
2025. This funding is aimed at revitalizing healthcare facilities,
improving emergency services, and enhancing accessibility for
individuals with disabilities. The institute is also pivoting towards
preventive care and digitalization while expanding services
through programs such as IMSS-Bienestar.

Despite some ongoing issues, such as medication shortages and
long wait times, there’s a steadfast belief among authorities that
the IMSS is stronger than ever and not on the brink of a disaster.



Plans are afoot to adapt to demographic changes, such as an
aging population and the rise of chronic diseases, which are
anticipated to require a strategic overhaul of services provided.

Systemic Challenges and the Path Ahead

Examining the broader context of health in Mexico, PubMed
notes that the country’s health system is a patchwork of
employment-based insurance, public assistance, and a
regulated private sector. While recent increases in national
health expenditure are encouraging, they still fall short of both
Latin America and the Caribbean averages and are significantly
below the OECD standards.

The IMSS serves as a cornerstone of this system, tasked with
covering a significant portion of the insured population, yet
many remain uninsured. The growing prevalence of health
issues such as obesity and diabetes presents a challenge to both
civil society and governmental efforts to redress inequities
within healthcare. As both groups push for better integration of
health services, the IMSS must adapt and respond to the
increasing demand while ensuring sustainability.

In conclusion, while the IMSS may face daunting financial
forecasts, its proactive measures and insights into public health
could pave the way for a more resilient future. The upcoming
years will be critical in shaping the landscape of Mexican
healthcare, and the IMSS is poised to either stand firm or falter
under the weight of its challenges.

For further details on IMSS’s situation, you can read the full
report on Merca20, or learn more from El Universal and the
analysis presented on PubMed.
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