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Exciting Week Ahead: Must-See Shows in
Southwest Florida Theaters!

Explore upcoming theater shows in Southwest Florida,
including &quot;Annie&quot; and &quot;Sweeney

Todd,&quot; running July 3-6, 2025.

Fort Myers, Florida, USA - This week marks the beginning of
July, bringing a vibrant array of theatrical performances to
audiences in Southwest Florida. With classics and new musical
adventures on the slate, there’s something for everyone soaking
up the sun. Prepare for entertaining nights out, as local theaters
roll out their offerings that span laughter, nostalgia, and musical
magic.

The much-anticipated opening show, „Annie,“ kicks off at the
Broadway Palm Dinner Theatre on July 3. This beloved musical
invites us into the life of little orphan Annie and her faithful dog
Sandy as they navigate the trials posed by Miss Hannigan.
Featuring catchy tunes like „It’s the Hard Knock Life,“ „Easy



Street,“ „Little Girls,“ and the inspiring „Tomorrow,“ it promises
to be a delightful experience. The show runs through August 9,
with performances scheduled for July 3 at 7:30 p.m., and
additional matinees and evening shows on July 5 and 6. For
more details, call 239-278-4422 or visit the Broadway Palm
website.

Limited Engagements and Final Shows

On July 3, the Florida Repertory Theatre will present a special
performance of „Annie JR.“ at 6 p.m. This condensed version
tells the same heartwarming story of Annie’s quest for her
parents in 1930s New York City. For ticket inquiries, reach out to
239-332-4488 or check the Florida Repertory Theatre
website.

Meanwhile, the Florida Repertory Theatre in the ArtStage Studio
Theatre bids farewell to “‘Til Death Do Us Part: Late Night
Catechism 3,” with its final performances on July 2 and 3 at 2
p.m. and 7 p.m. This humorous take on life lessons in marriage
and last rites provides an insightful yet laugh-filled experience.
Ticket details are also available at 239-332-4488 or the Florida
Repertory Theatre website.

Continuing Favorites

If you’re looking for something to keep your spirits high, „Dames
at Sea“ is the show to catch at the Florida Studio Theatre in
Gompertz Theatre, now extended until July 13. This charming
tale follows Ruby, a chorus girl striving for Broadway stardom.
Performances this week span from July 1 through July 6, offering
various times for guests. For tickets, contact 941-366-9000 or
visit the Florida Studio Theatre website.

Musical enthusiasts can also enjoy the engaging tribute „How
Sweet It Is,“ celebrating the legacy of Motown music. Running
through August 3, this vibrant cabaret features performances
from July 1 to July 6, providing multiple opportunities to relive
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those timeless hits. Tickets can be booked via the same number
or found at the Florida Studio Theatre website.

Last but certainly not least, don’t miss the spine-tingling drama
of „Sweeney Todd: The Demon Barber of Fleet Street“, running
at The Naples Players until July 27. Expect an eclectic mix of
dark humor and unforgettable melodies, with performances
scheduled throughout the week. Ticket info is available by
calling 239-263-7990 or visiting the The Naples Players
website.

This week’s array of performances is made possible through
generous community support, including notable donors such as
Betty & Don Abbott and the City of Fort Myers, among others,
who contribute to the thriving arts scene in Southwest Florida.
To learn more about the local theater initiatives backed by these
patrons, check out the Florida Rep website.

With such diverse options available, there’s no excuse not to
treat yourself to a night of stellar performances. Grab your
tickets now and get ready to be entertained!
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