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Backstreet Boy Brian Littrell Takes Legal
Action Over Beach Trespassers!

Brian Littrell of the Backstreet Boys sues Walton County
over trespassers on his Santa Rosa Beach property amid

beach access disputes.

Santa Rosa Beach, Florida, USA - Brian Littrell, the well-
known Backstreet Boys singer, is taking legal action against
Walton County, Florida, over trespassers at his property in Santa
Rosa Beach. He argues that the Walton County Sheriff’s Office is
not doing enough to control these unwelcome visitors. Littrell
has gone so far as to file a writ of mandamus to compel the
Sheriff’s Office to fulfill its duties and act on the matter. The
situation has become distressing for him and his family, as he
claims they are harassed daily despite putting up „No
Trespassing“ signs and setting up chairs and umbrellas to
delineate his private beach area. 

Littrell’s beach home in Santa Rosa Beach, a charming three-



bedroom property acquired for $3.8 million in 2023, is at the
heart of this dispute. He is not only battling with trespassers but
also facing an ongoing disagreement with neighbors about
beach access rights. It seems that the celebrated singer isn’t
just a hitmaker; he’s also stepping into the ring of local beach
politics. Littrell, married to Leighanne since 2000, has a 22-year-
old son, Baylee, who recently gained attention on American
Idol—adding another layer of interest to their family saga.

New Policies and Legal Context

The Walton County Sheriff’s Office has recently introduced a
new policy to handle calls regarding trespassing on Gulf front
properties. This policy, set to take effect on October 1, 2023,
comes in the wake of the Walton County Customary Use
Settlement Agreement designed for certain beachfront property
owners. This adjustment aims to clarify how the agency will
respond to complaints and enhance transparency within the
community. The new approach may be seen as a timely
response, especially considering the increasing conflicts over
beach access in the area—just like the one Littrell is
experiencing. More details about this new policy can be found at
Walton County’s website.

This local issue, intertwined with larger statewide discussions,
has gained further complexity due to recent legislative actions.
The Florida Senate recently voted overwhelmingly in favor of a
bill repealing a controversial 2018 law that restricted public
beach access. SB 1622, spearheaded by Sen. Jay Trumbull, aims
to restore public access to beaches in Walton County and other
coastal regions. The bill received a strong bipartisan backing
with only two dissenting votes, a clear indication of the public’s
desire for more accessible beaches. This repeal could pave the
way for significant renourishment projects, which were
previously hamstrung by the old law, allowing for an expansive
public beach in front of private properties around Destin, adding
an estimated 50 to 80 feet. For more details about this
legislative development, visit Get the Coast.

https://waltonso.org/records-request/trespassing-on-gulf-front-property-standard-operating-procedure/
https://www.getthecoast.com/bill-to-repeal-controversial-customary-use-statute-passes-in-florida-senate/


Community Reactions

The changes brought by SB 1622 have sparked lively
discussions within the community. As new sand placed beyond
the erosion control line becomes public by law, it highlights the
balance between private property rights and public access to
natural resources. Destin Mayor Bobby Wagner emphasized that
this bill will facilitate beach renourishment without requiring
unanimous approval from beachfront property owners. This is a
crucial point in reducing the tensions between public enjoyment
and private property claims.

As Brian Littrell navigates his legal battles, he is caught in the
crossfire of these broader discussions about beach accessibility
and private ownership. With rising tensions over trespassing and
ongoing community disputes, it remains to be seen how this
high-profile case will influence local sentiments and perhaps
even inform future legislation affecting beach access.
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