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Avow Expands Hospice Services in
Southwest Florida&#039;s Lee, Glades,

Hendry
Avow is set to expand hospice care to Glades County,

starting soon, enhancing healthcare services in Southwest
Florida.

Glades County, Florida, USA - In a momentous move for
hospice care in Southwest Florida, Avow has been selected by
the Florida Agency for Health Care Administration (AHCA) to
provide hospice services in Lee, Glades, and Hendry counties.
This decision follows the preliminary approval of Avow’s
Certificate of Need (CON) application, marking a significant step
in the organization’s mission to extend its compassionate care
across the region. The community can look forward to enhanced
hospice services that are mindful of local needs and high
standards of care, as detailed by North Fort Myers Neighbor.

https://www.northfortmyersneighbor.com/news/news-from-around-the-region/2025/06/avow-selected-to-provide-hospice-care-in-lee-glades-and-hendry-counties-2/


Avow is no stranger to this vital space in healthcare; founded in
1983 as Collier County’s original nonprofit hospice, the
organization has been a trusted provider of hospice care,
palliative care consultations, grief support, and home health
care. President and CEO, Jaysen Roa, expressed enthusiasm
about expanding services to neighboring counties, signaling
their commitment to reach as many families as possible during
life’s most difficult times. Meanwhile, Charles Hoffman, chairman
of the Avow board, thanked the community for their trust and
support in this critical service.

Understanding the Certificate of Need
Process

The Certificate of Need process plays a crucial role in ensuring
that healthcare services meet community needs and adhere to
quality standards. As noted by AHCA, Avow’s successful
application reflects its strong track record of over 40 years in
providing high-quality care, earning commendable ratings from
families and caregivers alike. This process is not merely
bureaucratic; it serves as a safeguard to ensure that
communities receive the healthcare they actually need.

In addition to Avow, various providers in the state, such as
Bristol Hospice and Odyssey HealthCare, are seeking to
establish or expand hospice programs. This competitive
landscape highlights the growing demand for hospice care
options across Florida, making initiatives like Avow’s particularly
vital.

Quality Standards in Hospice Care

To maintain high-quality hospice and palliative care,
organizations often pursue certification from reputable
accrediting bodies. As described by CAPC, this can include
various certifications that recognize exemplary programs, such
as those offered by The Joint Commission and the Accreditation

https://ahca.myflorida.com/site/health-quality-assurance/bureau-of-health-facility-regulation/certificate-of-need-and-commercial-managed-care-unit/certificate-of-need-con-program-overview/applications/application-received-february-2025
https://www.capc.org/quality-standards-and-certifications/


Commission for Health Care. Such certifications not only
enhance the credibility of care providers like Avow but also
ensure they are meeting rigorous quality standards and
adapting to the evolving needs of patients.

While Avow plans to serve patients in Lee, Glades, and Hendry
counties as soon as possible, the exact launch date remains
under wraps. However, their commitment to high-quality
hospice care remains steadfast, and the community’s
expectations are high. As we await the rollout, it’s clear that
Avow’s expansion is a win for families seeking compassionate
care in their time of need, embodying the principle that there’s a
good deal to be said for putting community at the heart of
healthcare.
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