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Key West Votes to End ICE Cooperation
Amid Community Outcry

Key West City Commission votes 6-1 to end its immigration
agreement with ICE, responding to community concerns

about local policing and immigration enforcement.

Key West, Florida, USA - The Key West City Commission has
made a definitive move to prioritize community welfare over
strict federal immigration enforcement. In a recent vote, the
commission decided to void an agreement that allowed local
police to assist federal agents from ICE in apprehending
suspected undocumented immigrants. WLRN reports that this
decision came after significant public outcry from local
residents, business owners, and church leaders, who voiced
their opposition during a special meeting that lasted nearly two
hours.

The resolution passed with a notable majority, achieving a 6-1
vote among commissioners. It is important to note that the
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agreement had been secretly signed by Police Chief Sean
Brandenburg, who reportedly felt pressured to do so due to
threats from Florida Attorney General James Uthmeier about
potential removal from office should he not comply with the ICE
program. City Manager Brian Barrosso was aware of this
agreement, but it had not received the sanction of the
commissioners, which City Attorney Kendal Harden indicated
renders it void.

Backlash Against Overreach

Commissioner Samuel Kaufman highlighted the necessity of
protecting political asylum seekers within the community while
Commissioner Donald “Donie” Lee characterized the situation as
a serious case of federal and state overreach. The commission
also laid down instructions that will prevent the police chief from
entering into any further agreements until a related lawsuit from
South Miami clarifies the necessary requirements regarding the
widely debated 287(g) agreements.

The 287(g) program, which trains local law enforcement to
interrogate and detain immigrants, has seen significant
expansion under the previous administration. The ILRC notes
that more than 650 such agreements currently exist nationwide,
with nearly 250 police agencies in Florida involved. While
proponents argue this collaboration aids in removing unlawfully
present individuals who may commit crimes, the reality on the
ground tells a different story.

Impact on the Community

The local immigrant community has reported an alarming
climate of fear stemming from increased ICE enforcement
activities. The Key West Immigrant Support Network has voiced
concerns that ICE agents have even been rounding up
immigrants with legal residency. This has not only unsettled
families but transformed daily life in Key West, with residents
less likely to attend religious services, go shopping, or even
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send their children to school due to fear of apprehension.

Efforts are being made to address these concerns at higher
levels. Community members have reached out to U.S. Rep.
Carlos Gimenez and state Rep. Jim Mooney, bringing their
worries about the rising presence of ICE agents to the attention
of lawmakers. As the fabric of this vibrant community hangs in
the balance, the decisions made in the city’s administration
reflect a significant step toward restoring safety and dignity for
all its residents.

As constituents look for assurance that their local government
will prioritize them and their rights, the move to end the 287(g)
agreement resonates with many as a meaningful action. Key
West stands as a testament to the ongoing dialogue about
immigration in America—often fraught, yet essential.
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