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Tampa Mourns: Councilwoman
Gwendolyn Henderson&#039;s Legacy

Lives On
Remembering Gwendolyn Henderson: Tampa City

Councilwoman honored in a homegoing service after her
passing at 60, celebrating her legacy.

Tampa, Florida, USA - The city of Tampa is mourning the loss
of Gwendolyn Henderson, a dedicated public servant and
community advocate, who passed away last week at the age of
60. Known for her unwavering commitment to the community,
Henderson was not just a Tampa City Council member; she was
a lifelong educator, a bookstore owner, and an activist deeply
rooted in her city’s history and culture. Her death was confirmed
on June 10, 2025, by both Mayor Jane Castor and City Council
Chairman Alan Clendenin, leaving a profound impact on those
who knew her and the many lives she touched.



On Tuesday, a homegoing service will be held at 11 a.m. at Allen
Temple African Methodist Episcopal Church in Tampa. The
service is open to the public and will be streamed live on the
ABC Action News site and Facebook, allowing those who cannot
attend in person to participate in honoring her legacy. The city
of Tampa has extended its condolences to her family,
emphasizing the tremendous loss felt within the community.

A Powerful Advocate for Education and
Equity

Henderson’s life was a testament to her passion for education
and equity. As a teacher for 23 years with Hillsborough County
Public Schools, she focused on the needs of future generations.
After being elected to the Tampa City Council in May 2023, she
quickly made her mark, becoming Chair of the Community
Redevelopment Agency. She represented District 5, a diverse
area that is nearly 50% Black, and was a fierce advocate for
affordable housing and public safety, with an unwavering
commitment to economic opportunity for all residents.

Mayor Castor remarked on Henderson’s leadership qualities,
expressing that she was admired for her „strength, dignity and
unwavering respect.“ Her colleagues, including U.S. Rep. Kathy
Castor, highlighted her advocacy, particularly for community
initiatives that uplifted the voices and histories of marginalized
communities.

Remembering Her Roots

Born on October 5, 1964, in Carver City, Tampa, Henderson was
proud of her roots. She graduated from Jefferson High School
before earning her undergraduate degree in education from
Florida Agricultural and Mechanical University and a master’s
degree from Saint Leo University. She often spoke of her family
history, sharing the story of her great-great-grandfather, Sam
Hightower, who was born into slavery. This connection to her



ancestry deeply informed her commitment to social justice and
community empowerment.

Beyond her council role, she was a co-owner of the Black English
Bookstore, which she opened with her daughter Ariel. The
bookstore served as a cultural hub, promoting African American
literature and history, significantly contributing to the
enrichment of the local community. Henderson’s many roles,
from teacher to activist to business owner, showcased her
multifaceted dedication to making a difference.

The Path Ahead

With Henderson’s passing, the city is now faced with the task of
filling her council seat. A Special Election will need to be called
within ten days of her death, allowing five business days for
candidates to qualify. The election will take place on the fourth
Tuesday following the qualifying deadline, and it may result in a
runoff if a candidate does not secure over 50% of the vote. This
election will be essential for maintaining the voice of District 5,
continuing the legacy of a leader who fought for representation
and community empowerment.

As the Tampa community comes together to celebrate
Gwendolyn Henderson’s life and legacy, her influence will
undoubtedly linger in the hearts of those she inspired. There’s
something to be said for a life dedicated to service, and
Henderson’s journey exemplifies that commitment. Her
dedication to education, equity, and community will not be
forgotten.

For further details about the upcoming homegoing service,
check out ABC Action News. More on her remarkable career
can be found in coverage by WUSF and Florida Politics.

Details

https://www.abcactionnews.com/news/region-hillsborough/tampa-city-councilwoman-gwendolyn-henderson-to-be-honored-with-homegoing-service
https://www.wusf.org/text/politics-issues/2025-06-10/gwen-henderson-dies-tampa-teacher-council-member-black-english-bookstore-owner
https://floridapolitics.com/archives/742666-tampa-city-council-member-gwendolyn-henderson-60-has-died/


Ort Tampa, Florida, USA
Quellen www.abcactionnews.com

www.wusf.org
floridapolitics.com

Besuchen Sie uns auf: mein-wien.net

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

https://www.abcactionnews.com/news/region-hillsborough/tampa-city-councilwoman-gwendolyn-henderson-to-be-honored-with-homegoing-service
https://www.wusf.org/text/politics-issues/2025-06-10/gwen-henderson-dies-tampa-teacher-council-member-black-english-bookstore-owner
https://floridapolitics.com/archives/742666-tampa-city-council-member-gwendolyn-henderson-60-has-died/
https://mein-wien.net
http://www.tcpdf.org

